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Freedom of Information request: FOI2026/00276

Thank you for your Freedom of Information request received on the 30 March in which you requested the
following:

Your request:
Under the Freedom of Information Act, can you please provide:
1) the most recent mid-point review for:

a) Administrative Data Research UK (to the extent that MRC holds this information about ADRUK),
b) Data and Analytics Research Environments UK programme,

¢) Health Data Research UK,

d) Population Research UK,

e) UK Biobank,

f) UK Health Data Research Alliance,

2) the response of each organisation (a-f) to the findings of their review.
The staffing and financial/spending detail within those reviews are not of interest and need not be provided.
Our response

| can confirm that UK Research and Innovation (UKRI) do not hold information relevant to your request. Searches
of our records show that neither UKRI nor the Medical Research Council (MRC) hold information within the scope
of your request.

MRC does not hold any mid-point reviews within the scope of your request. This is because MRC maintains
continuous engagement with these investments and does not undertake formal mid-point reviews. Progress is
monitored and discussed through established management structures and agreed monitoring and evaluation
mechanisms, which operate on an ongoing basis. Large-scale reviews are conducted at the end of the funding
cycle for each investment, with the format varying depending on the nature of the investment.

Your rights

If you have any queries regarding our response, please do let us know. If you are dissatisfied with the handling of
your request, you have the right to ask for an internal review, explaining which elements of this decision you
disagree with and why. Internal review requests should be submitted within 40 working days of the date of our
response and should be addressed to:

Head of Information Governance

Email: foi@ukri.org

UK Research and Innovation, Polaris House, North Star Avenue, Swindon SN2 1FL www_ukri.org


mailto:foi@ukri.org

Please quote the reference number above in any future communications.

If you are still not content with the outcome of the internal review, you may apply to refer the matter to the
Information Commissioner for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted
the review procedure provided by UKRI. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: www.ico.org.uk

If you wish to raise a complaint regarding the service you have received or the conduct of any UKRI staff in
relation to your request, please see UKRI's complaints procedure.’

Yours sincerely,

|n|ormat|on !overnance

Information Rights Team
UK Research and Innovation
foi@ukri.org | dataprotection@uksri.org
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