



16 June 2020

Freedom of Information request: FOI2020/00141

Thank you for your Freedom of Information request received on the 19 May 2020 in which you requested the following:

Your request:

Please could you advice the following information:

- 1. Whether you hold a record of a JESP job evaluation score for the advertised position of Deputy Director of Analysis based in UKRI (job role attached).*
- 2. If you hold a JESP score, please could you tell me what it is and provide me with a break down of the score by JESP factors*
- 3. Tell me the date at which the JESP evaluation was done*
- 4. Tell me whether the JESP assessment was done by a UKRI employee or external body*

Our response

I can confirm UK Research and Innovation (UKRI) hold some of the information relevant to your request. Please see the information below.

- 1. Whether you hold a record of a JESP job evaluation score for the advertised position of Deputy Director of Analysis based in UKRI (job role attached).*

No record of a JESP evaluation is held by UKRI. The role of Deputy Director of Analysis originates from the creation of a shadow UKRI function, when the position was moved across from the Department of Business, Energy and Industrial Strategy (BEIS) to UKRI. The grading was established under BEIS processes, and therefore no record of any assessments are held by UKRI.

BEIS can be contacted on the following email address: foi.requests@beis.gov.uk

- 2. If you hold a JESP score, please could you tell me what it is and provide me with a break down of the score by JESP factors*

Information not held, please see Q1.

- 3. Tell me the date at which the JESP evaluation was done*

Information not held, please see Q1

- 4. Tell me whether the JESP assessment was done by a UKRI employee or external body*

Any assessments on this role would have been carried out by BEIS, an external body.

If you have any queries regarding our response or you are unhappy with the outcome of your request and wish to seek an internal review of the decision, please contact:

Head of Information Governance

Email: foi@ukri.org or infogovernance@ukri.org

Please quote the reference number above in any future communications.

If you are still not content with the outcome of the internal review, you may apply to refer the matter to the Information Commissioner for a decision. Generally, the ICO cannot make a decision unless you have exhausted the review procedure provided by UKRI. The Information Commissioner can be contacted at: <http://www.ico.gov.uk/>

If you wish to raise a complaint regarding the service you have received or the conduct of any UKRI staff in relation to your request, please see UKRI's complaints policy: <https://www.ukri.org/about-us/policies-and-standards/complaints-policy/>

Yours sincerely,


Information Governance
Information Rights Team
UK Research and Innovation
foi@ukri.org | dataprotection@ukri.org